

PROJECT: Uptown Market Rebid

DATE: 2/18/15

OWNER: City of Greenwood

PLACE: Conference Room 230, Municipal Building
520 Monument Street, Greenwood, SC

TIME: 2:00 PM

BID TABULATION

JOB NO.: 10917.22 (0003)

CONTRACTOR	Contractors Lic. License	Bid Bond	Addendum 1 - 4	BASE BID	ALTERNATE	UNIT PRICE	SUBCONTRACTORS			
Clayton Construction	G-13521	X	X	\$2,354,000.00	1)	+96,000	1)	12.00	Concrete	Clayton
									Masonry	Feltman Brothers
									Roofing	Allcon Roofing
									Plumbing	AT&H Plumbing
									HVAC	AM Mechanical
									Electrical	Davis Electric
Jimmy Davis Construction				NO BID	2)		2)	15.00	Glulam Manuf.	Arkansas Laminating
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)	0.60	Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
									Electrical	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	1)		1)		Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
									Electrical	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	2)		2)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
									Electrical	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	
RJ Dean Construction				NO BID	3)		3)		Glulam Manuf.	
									Concrete	
									Masonry	
									Roofing	
									Plumbing	
									HVAC	

PROJECT: Uptown Market Rebid

DATE: 2/18/15

OWNER: City of Greenwood

PLACE: Conference Room 230, Municipal Building
520 Monument Street, Greenwood, SC

TIME: 2:00 PM

BID TABULATION

JOB NO.: 10917.22 (0003)

CONTRACTOR	Contractors Lic. License	Bid Bond	Addendum 1 - 4	BASE BID	ALTERNATE	UNIT PRICE	SUBCONTRACTORS	
FBI Construction				NO BID	1)	1)	Concrete	
							Masonry	
					2)	2)	Roofing	
							Plumbing	
							HVAC	
MSK Construction	G-118648	X	X	\$2,474,000.00	1) <41,000>	1) 13.00	Concrete	Combs
							Masonry	Mid-State
					2)	2) 16.00	Roofing	M.T. Price
							Plumbing	KSBG
							HVAC	Cullum
Marsh-Bell	G-11901	X	X	\$2,312,000.00	1) <30,000>	1) 19.80	Concrete	Tri-State
							Masonry	Feltman Brothers
					2)	2) 27.50	Roofing	Heritage
							Plumbing	Commercial Ind.
							HVAC	Mountain View
		Electrical	Davis Electric					
		Glulam Manuf.	Arkansas Laminating					

PROJECT: Uptown Market Rebid

DATE: 2/18/15

OWNER: City of Greenwood

PLACE: Conference Room 230, Municipal Building
520 Monument Street, Greenwood, SC

TIME: 2:00 PM

BID TABULATION

JOB NO.: 10917.22 (0003)

CONTRACTOR	Contractors Lic.	Bid Bond	Addendum 1 - 4	BASE BID	ALTERNATE	UNIT PRICE	SUBCONTRACTORS	
Matrix Construction Co.	G95725	X	X	\$2,341,558.00	1) <72,561>	1) 18.00	Concrete	Reed
							Masonry	Feltman Brothers
							Roofing	M.T. Price
							Plumbing	AT&H
							HVAC	Cullum Mechanical
							Electrical	Davis Electric
Melloul-Blamey Const.	G109030	X	X	\$2,129,000.00	1) <94,419>	1) 18.00	Concrete	M. Blamey
							Masonry	Cherokee
							Roofing	M.T. Price
							Plumbing	AT&H
							HVAC	AM Mechanical
							Electrical	Quality Electric
North Lake Const. Co.	G11714	X	X	\$2,487,000.00	1) <57,500>	1) 24.00	Concrete	All American
							Masonry	Mid South
							Roofing	M.T. Price
							Plumbing	AT&H
							HVAC	Cullum Mechanical
							Electrical	Davis Electric
					3)	3) 0.33	Glulam Manuf.	Arkansas Laminating
					2)	2) 25.00		
					3)	3) 0.34		
					2)	2) 35.00		
					3)	3) 2.00		

PROJECT: Uptown Market Rebid

DATE: 2/18/15

OWNER: City of Greenwood

PLACE: Conference Room 230, Municipal Building
520 Monument Street, Greenwood, SC

TIME: 2:00 PM

BID TABULATION

JOB NO.: 10917.22 (0003)

CONTRACTOR	Contractors Lic. License	Bid Bond	Addendum 1 - 4	BASE BID	ALTERNATE	UNIT PRICE	SUBCONTRACTORS		
Roebuck Buildings Co.				NO BID	1)	1)	Concrete		
							Masonry		
							Roofing		
							Plumbing		
							HVAC		
							Electrical		
IPW Construciton Group	G117838	X	X	\$2,440,444.00	1)	<83,841>	1) 19.21	Concrete	T&C
							2) 27.00	Masonry	Mid-State
								Roofing	M.T. Price
								Plumbing	Plumb Ready
								HVAC	Cullum
								Electrical	Davis Electric
Uldrick Builders	G11638	X	X	\$2,874,000.00	1)	<121,935>	1) 30.00	Concrete	Somero Ind.
							2) 30.00	Masonry	Cherokee
								Roofing	Heritage
								Plumbing	KSBG Systems, Inc.
								HVAC	Palmetto Systems
								Electrical	West Electric
	3) 0.50	Glulam Manuf.	Timber Systems						

I, Brent Robertson, certify that this is a correct and true tabulation of bids as received on February 18, 2015.

Brent Robertson, Vice-President, PE #19856